
ADMINISTRATIVE ACTION REPORT October 5, 2022 

I. GENERAL MATTERS 

The following items have been approved: 

Dual Degree - Both Existing 
IUPUI - B.S. in Informatics (IU) and M.S. in Cybersecurity and Trusted Systems (PU) -
online 

New Certificate - Stand-Alone 
IUPUI - Post-Baccalaureate Certificate in Health Information Management - online 

II. CONSTRUCTION MATTERS 
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II. CONSTRUCTION MATTERS

 Construction Contract Awards and Bid Tabulations

IUB – Gladstein Fieldhouse – Turf Installation 

Date of Bid Opening: August 11, 2022 
IU Project Number: 20220394 
Bidders: 1 
Contract Award: Kiefer America, LLC 
Amount: $259,820.00 
Estimate: $377,061.76 
Funding: Athletics Department Renovation Funds 
Architect: Fanning/Howey Associates, Inc. 

Kiefer America, 
LLC Estimate 

Base Bid $259,820.00 $377,061.76 
Total Amount Awarded $259,820.00 $377,061.76 

This project consists of selective removal of existing polyurethane athletic flooring and 
installation of new artificial turf for indoor field hockey practice. Work includes resurfacing 
polyurethane areas for track and field use. 

Bidders: Base Bid 
Keifer America, LLC, Lindenhurst, IL $259,820.00 

IUB – Simon Music Library & Recital Center – Fire Alarm Upgrade 

Date of Bid Opening: August 10, 2022 
IU Project Number: 20181045 
Bidders: 2 
Contract Award: Cassady Electrical Contractors, Inc. 
Amount: $781,650.00 
Estimate: $829,774.36 
Funding: Repair and Rehabilitation Funds 
Architect: SCO Engineering, LLC 

Cassady Electrical 
Contractors, Inc. Estimate 

Base Bid $781,650.00 $829,774.36 
Total Amount Awarded $781,650.00 $829,774.36 

This project consists of installing a complete addressable voice microprocessor-based fire 
alarm system with initiating devices, notification appliances, and monitoring. Work includes 
removing existing fire alarm devices along with associated conduit, raceways and 
conductors. 

Bidders: Base Bid 
Cassady Electrical Contractors Inc., Ellettsville, IN $781,650.00 

Approved 

 

Thomas A. Morrison, Vice President 
for Capital Planning & Facilities 

Thomas A. Morrison (by RML)
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Connect Electric Inc., Jamestown, IN $827,500.00 

IUB – Auditorium – Tuckpointing 

Date of Bid Opening: August 9, 2022 
IU Project Number: 20210406 
Bidders: 4 
Contract Award: Wells Masonry & Restoration, Inc. 
Amount: $277,600.00 
Estimate: $535,000.00 
Funding: Repair and Rehabilitation Funds 
Architect: ARSEE Engineers 

Wells Masonry & 
Restoration, Inc. Estimate 

Base Bid $191,800.00 $395,000.00 
Alternate 1 $61,800.00 $100,000.00 
Alternate 2 $24,000.00 $40,000.00 
Total Amount Awarded $277,600.00 $535,000.00 

This project consists of exterior masonry repairs and restorations to a portion of the west 
elevation, accessibility ramp, and blind story. 

Bidders: 
Wells Masonry & Restoration, Inc., New Palestine, IN 
Heritage Masonry Restoration Co., LLC, Indianapolis, IN 
Browning Chapman, LLC, Westfield, IN 
Buckeye Construction & Restoration, Ltd., Waterford, OH 

Wells Masonry & 
Restoration, Inc. 

Heritage Masonry 
Restoration Co., 

LLC 
Browning 

Chapman, LLC 
Base Bid $191,800.00 $248,161.00 $289,700.00 
Alternate 1 $61,800.00 $91,896.00 $64,700.00 
Alternate 2 $24,000.00 $25,600.00 $117,000.00 
Alternate 3 No Bid $20,000.00 $15,700.00 

Buckeye 
Construction & 

Restoration, Ltd. 
Base Bid $340,252.00 
Alternate 1 $93,443.00 
Alternate 2 $85,384.00 
Alternate 3 $250,000.00 

IUPUI – Camp Brosius – Swimming Dock 

Date of Bid Opening: July 14, 2022 
IU Project Number: 20210044 
Bidders: 2 
Contract Award: Jos. Schmitt & Sons Const. Co., Inc. 
Amount: $178,343.00 
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Estimate: $250,000.00  
Funding: Camp Brosius Reserves 
Architect: Distinctive Design Studio 

Jos. Schmitt & 
Sons Const. Co., 

Inc. Estimate 
Base Bid $178,343.00 $250,000.00 
Total Amount Awarded $178,343.00 $250,000.00 

This project consists of repairing and replacing the swimming dock deck and its support 
structure. Work includes installing stairs, a light pole, and filling in the sand bed and stone 
rip rap below deck. 

Bidders: Base Bid 
Jos. Schmitt Construction, Sheboygan, WI $178,343.00 
A. Chappa Construction, LLC, Sheboygan Falls, WI $220,790.00 

IUPUI – Emerson Hall – 4th Floor Renovation 

Date of Bid Opening: August 17, 2022 
IU Project Number: 20220246 
Bidders: 4 
Contract Award: SCS Construction Services, Inc. 
Amount: $1,666,000.00 
Estimate: $1,782,819.08 
Funding: School of Medicine Designated Funds 
Architect: arcDESIGN 

SCS Construction 
Services, Inc. Estimate 

Base Bid $1,426,000.00 $1,569,819.08 
Alternate 1 $118,000.00 $78,000.00 
Alternate 2 $122,000.00 $135,000.00 
Total Amount Awarded $1,666,000.00 $1,782,819.08 

This project consists of renovating an existing laboratory and office space into a suite for 
the Surgery Chair, a shared Surgery Suite, and support spaces. Work includes upgrading 
restrooms for accessibility and a Wellness Room will be added. Mechanical, electrical, 
plumbing and fire protection upgrades for the entire floor is included. 

Bidders: 
SCS Construction Services, Inc., Greenwood, IN 
J.C. Ripberger Construction Corporation, Zionsville, IN
Courteous Contractors, LLC, Zionsville, IN 
Weddle Bros. Building Group, LLC, Bloomington, IN 

SCS Construction 
Services, Inc. 

J.C. Ripberger
Construction
Corporation

Courteous 
Contractors, LLC 

Base Bid $1,426,000.00 $1,431,000.00 $1,626,319.00 
Alternate 1 $118,000.00 $136,000.00 $105,170.00 
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Alternate 2 $122,000.00 $168,000.00 $139,107.00 
Alternate 3 $8,000.00 No Bid $27,000.00 

Weddle Bros. 
Building Group, LLC 

Base Bid $1,752,650.00 
Alternate 1 $106,000.00 
Alternate 2 $127,300.00 
Alternate 3 $40,100.00 

IUPUI – Emerson Hall – Restroom Renovation 

Date of Bid Opening: August 17, 2022 
IU Project Number: 20210460 
Bidders: 4 
Contract Award: SCS Construction Services, Inc. 
Amount: $290,100.00 
Estimate: $291,100.00 
Funding: Repair and Rehabilitation Funds 
Architect: INFLUENCE architecture + interiors 

SCS Construction 
Services, Inc. Estimate 

Base Bid $400,100.00 $291,100.00 
Alternate 1 ($110,000.00) -- 
Total Amount Awarded $290,100.00 $291,100.00 

This project consists of renovating the first and second floor restrooms and includes 
replacing walls, doors, flooring, ceiling and plumbing fixtures. Work includes new light 
fixtures, a new roof exhaust fan and accessibility modifications. 

Bidders: 
Embrey Construction Inc., Trafalgar, IN 
Ferguson Construction Co. - Indiana, Greenfield, IN 
SCS Construction Services, Inc., Greenwood, IN 
J.C. Ripberger Construction Corporation, Zionsville, IN

Embrey 
Construction Inc. 

Ferguson 
Construction Co. - 

Indiana 
SCS Construction 

Services, Inc. 
Base Bid $298,845.00 $312,900.00 $400,100.00 
Alternate 1 N/A No Bid ($110,000.00) 

J.C. Ripberger
Construction
Corporation

Base Bid $424,400.00 
Alternate 1 ($10,000.00) 

IUS – Life Science Building – Roof Replacement 
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Date of Bid Opening: August 19, 2022 
IU Project Number: 20192732 
Bidders: 5 
Contract Award: Steve’s Roofing & Sheet Metal 
Amount: $704,400.00 
Estimate: $864,938.75  
Funding: Regional Campus Deferred Maintenance 
Architect: INFLUENCE architecture + interiors 

Steve’s Roofing & 
Sheet Metal Estimate 

Base Bid $704,400.00 $864,938.75 
Total Amount Awarded $704,400.00 $864,938.75 

This project consists of replacing the roofing system for all flat roofs including tear off and 
disposal of existing materials, aluminum coping and stainless-steel counter flashing. Work 
includes installing a roof access ladder system. 

Bidders: 
Steve's Roofing & Sheet Metal, Bloomington, IN 
Foster Contracting, Inc., Indianapolis, IN 
American Roofing and Metal Co., Louisville, KY 
B&L Sheet Metal and Roofing a Tecta America Company, 
Bloomington, IN 
Equity Builders of Bloomington, Inc., Bloomington, IN 

Steve's Roofing & 
Sheet Metal 

Foster Contracting, 
Inc. 

American Roofing 
and Metal Co. 

Base Bid $704,400.00 $728,000.00 $774,943.00 
Alternate 1 $8,400.00 $4,200.00 $15,000.00 
Alternate 2 no bid no bid no bid 

B&L Sheet Metal 
and Roofing a Tecta 
America Company 

Equity Builders of 
Bloomington, Inc. 

Base Bid $857,000.00 $950,000.00 
Alternate 1 ($17,000.00) $80,000.00 
Alternate 2 no bid $165,000.00 
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III. NAMING MATTERS

No items. 

IV. PERSONNEL MATTERS

IUB –Executive Vice President and IUB Provost Rahul Shrivastav 

Leaves of Absence and Sabbaticals 

College of Arts and Sciences 

For Rob de Ruyter, Professor of Physics, partial leave of absence with partial pay under the 
IU Phased Retirement plan for the period August 1, 2022 to May 31, 2025. 

For Michelle Facos, Professor of History of Art, and Adjunct Professor of Jewish Studies, 
partial leave of absence with partial pay under the IU Phased Retirement plan for the period 
August 1, 2022 to May 31, 2025. 

For Jessica Calarco, Associate Professor of Sociology, leave of absence without pay for the 
second semester of the 2022-2023 academic and the first semester of the 2023-2024 
academic year. 

For Barbara Lisa Hillers, Associate Professor of Folklore and Ethnomusicology, partial leave 
of absence with partial pay for the first semester of the 2022-2023 academic year. 

For Judith Rodriguez, Assistant Professor of African American and African Diaspora Studies, 
and Adjunct Assistant Professor of English, prestigious leave of absence without pay for the 
2022-2023 academic year to accept a fellowship at Stanford.   

Jacobs School of Music 

For Giovanni Zanovello, Associate Professor of Musicology, partial leave of absence with 
partial pay for the first semester of the 2022-2023 academic year. 

Reappointments and Changes in Status 

College of Arts and Sciences 

For Armin P. Moczek, Class of 1955 Endowed Professor of Biology, the additional title as Co-
Director of the Holland Science Program for the period July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025. 

For Pravina Shukla, Provost Professor of Folklore and Ethnomusicology, Adjunct Professor of 
American Studies, and Adjunct Professor of Anthropology, the additional title as Interim 
Chairperson of the Department of Folklore and Ethnomusicology for the period July 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2023. 

For John E. Bates, Professor of Psychological and Brain Sciences, the additional title as 
Director of Clinical Training for the period July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2024.   

For Tyron Cooper, a change in title from Associate Professor of African American and African 
Diaspora Studies to Associate Professor of Folklore and Ethnomusicology beginning August 
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1, 2022, while retaining the title as Director of Archives of African American Music and 
Culture.   
 
For Sonia Song-Ha Lee, Associate Professor of American Studies, Associate Professor of 
Latino Studies, and Adjunct Associate Professor of African American and African Diaspora 
Studies, the additional title as Associate Director of the Center for Research on Race and 
Ethnicity in Society, Office of the Vice Provost for Research, for the period July 1, 2022 to 
June 30, 2025. 
 
For Leslie Gabriela Del Carpio, a change in title from Acting Assistant Professor to Assistant 
Professor of Spanish and Portuguese for the period August 1, 2022 to May 31, 2025.  
 
Hamilton Lugar School of Global and International Studies 
 
For Sarah Bauerle Danzman, Associate Professor of International Studies, the additional title 
as Director of the Randall L. and Deborah F. Tobias Center for Innovation in International 
Development for the period July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2024. 
 
For Alwiya Saleh Omar, Clinical Professor of African Studies, the additional title as Director 
of the National African Language Resource Center (NALRC) for the period August 1, 2022 to 
June 30, 2023. 
 
Jacobs School of Music 
 
For Rodney Cedric Dorsey, Professor of Bands, reappointment as Chairperson of the 
Department of Bands for the 2022-2023 academic year. 
 
For Lissa Fleming May, Otto Nothhacksberger Chair, Professor of Music Education, and 
Associate Dean of Instruction, the additional title as Co-Chairperson of Guitar for the period 
August 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023.  
 
For Kevin Edward Murphy, Professor of Opera Theatre, a change in title from Co-
Chairperson to Co-Director of the Chamber Music and Collaborative Piano Program for the 
2022-2023 academic year. 
 
Kelley School of Business 
 
For Michael Roy Baye, Professor of Economics and Public Policy, and Adjunct Professor of 
Economics, College of Arts and Sciences, reappointment as Bert Elwert Professor of 
Economics and Public Policy for the period July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2027. 
 
For Vijay Khatri, Judith Norman Davis and Kim G. Davis Professor of Business Analytics, 
Department of Operations and Decision Technologies, a change in title from Associate Dean 
for Information, Instructional Technologies and Academics to Executive Associate Dean for 
Strategy, Innovation, and Technology for the period August 1, 2022 to July 31, 2025. 
 
For Neil Antony Morgan, PETsMart, Inc. Distinguished Professor in Marketing, dropping the 
title as Chairperson of the Department of Marketing effective August 14, 2022.   
 
For Jun Yang, Conrad Prebys Professor, and Professor of Finance, a change in title from Co-
Chairperson to Chairperson of the Department of Finance for the period August 1, 2022 to 
August 14, 2024.   
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For Josh Perry, Graf Family Professor of Business Law and Ethics, a change in title from 
Chairperson of the Department of Business Law and Ethics to Associate Dean for Academics 
for the period August 1, 2022 to July 31, 2025. 
 
For Paola Martin, a change in title from Acting Assistant Professor to Assistant Professor of 
Operations and Decision Technologies for the period July 1, 2022 to May 31, 2025. 
 
For P. Roberto Garcia, Clinical Professor of Management and Entrepreneurship, 
reappointment as Director of the Center for International Business Education and Research 
(CIBER) for the period October 1, 2022 to September 30, 2025. 
 
Luddy School of Informatics, Computing, and Engineering 
 
For Raj Acharya, Rudy Professor of Engineering, Professor of Informatics, and Adjunct 
Professor of Medical and Molecular Genetics, IUPUI, dropping the title as Associate Vice 
President for Research for AI Innovation, effective September 11, 2022.   
 
School of Education 
 
For Kathryn Ellerhoff Engebretson, Associate Professor of Curriculum and Instruction, the 
additional title as Associate Chairperson of the Department of Curriculum and Instruction for 
the period August 1, 2022 to July 31, 2024. 
 
For Sylvia Martinez, Associate Professor of Educational Leadership and Policy Studies, the 
additional title as Director of the Center for Research on Race and Ethnicity in Society, 
Office of the Vice Provost for Research for the period July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025. 
 
University Libraries 
 
For Matthew Robert Vaughn, a change in title from Library Services Coordinator to Visiting 
Assistant Librarian for the period September 1, 2022 to August 31, 2024. 
 
Resignations and Cancellations 
 
College of Arts and Sciences 
 
For Rasul A. Mowatt, Professor of Geography, Professor of American Studies, and Adjunct 
Professor of African American and African Diaspora Studies, resignation effective September 
6, 2022. 
 
University Libraries 
 
For Nicholas Mark Homenda, Associate Librarian, Digital Projects, resignation effective 
December 2, 2022, to accept a position at Tufts University Tisch Library.   
 
For Scott Phillip Libson, Assistant Librarian, History, resignation effective November 11, 
2022, to accept a position at Yale University.   
 
Visiting Appointments 
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University Libraries 
 
For James Henry Smith, Visiting Assistant Librarian, Literacy Librarian, for the period 
September 6, 2022 to September 5, 2024. 
 
For Haley Janelle Norris, Visiting Assistant Librarian, Diversity Resident: Scholarly 
Communication for the period September 23, 2022 to September 22, 2025. 
 
IUPUI – Interim Executive Vice President and IUPUI Chancellor Andrew R. Klein 
 
Initial Appointments 
 
School of Dentistry 
 
Hawra N J A Q AlQallaf, Clinical Assistant Professor, Department of Periodontics and Allied 
Dental Programs, for the period September 26, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Bill Chung, Clinical Professor, Department of Oral Surgery and Hospital Dentistry, OMFS 
Residency Program Director, for the period September 26, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Meenarin Panittaveekul, Clinical Assistant Professor, Department of Prosthodontics, for the 
period September 12, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
School of Health and Human Sciences 
 
Kristin R. Hull, Clinical Assistant Professor, Department of Occupational Therapy, for the 
period October 1, 2022 to May 31, 2023.  
 
School of Informatics and Computing 
 
Hee T. Jung, Assistant Professor, Department of BioHealth Informatics, for the period 
September 12, 2022 to May 31, 2023.  
 
School of Science  
 
Hye J. Jang, Professor, Department of Computer and Information Science, for the period 
August 1, 2022 to May 31, 2023.  
 
Reappointments and Changes of Status 
 
IUPUC 
 
For Scott A. Desmond, Assistant Professor of Sociology, Division of Liberal Arts, the 
additional title of Criminal Justice Program Director, for the period July 1, 2022 to May 31, 
2025.  
 
Meredith J. Stewart, a change in title from Visiting Lecturer, Division of Health Sciences to 
Clinical Assistant Professor of Nursing, Division of Health Sciences, for the period August 1, 
2022 to May 31, 2025.  
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School of Dentistry 
 
For Odette Aguirre, a change in title from Visiting Clinical Assistant Professor to Clinical 
Assistant Professor, Department of Biomedical Sciences and Comprehensive Care, for the 
period July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
School of Education  
 
For Crystal H. Morton, Associate Professor, Adjunct Associate Professor, Department of 
World Languages and Cultures, School of Liberal Arts, the additional title of Associate Dean, 
Research and Faculty Development, for the period August 1, 2022 to May 31, 2023.  
 
For Cristina C. Santamaria Graff, Associate Professor, the additional title of Interim Assistant 
Dean for Student Support and Diversity, for the period June 1, 2021 to May 31, 2023.  
 
Fairbanks School of Public Health 
 
Christopher A.W. Harle, Professor, Department of Health Policy and Management, the 
additional title of Interim Chair, Department of Health Policy and Management, for the 
period October 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023.   
 
School of Health and Human Sciences  
 
For Stuart J. Warden, Professor, Department of Physical Therapy, the additional title of 
Chancellor’s Professor, effective August 1, 2022.  
 
For JoAnne L. Whelan, a change in title from Visiting Clinical Assistant Professor to Clinical 
Assistant Professor, Department of Nutrition and Dietetics, for the period August 1, 2022 to 
May 31, 2023.  
 
School of Informatics and Computing  
 
For Jingwen Yan, Associate Professor, Department of BioHealth Informatics, the additional 
title of Director, BioInformatics Program, for the period August 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023.  
 
School of Liberal Arts  
 
For Paul R. Mullins, Professor, Department of Anthropology, the additional title of 
Chancellor’s Professor, effective July 1, 2022.  
 
School of Science  
 
For Randall J. Roper, Professor, Department of Biology, the additional title of Director, IUPUI 
Grad Mentoring Center, for the period August 1, 2022 to May 31, 2023.  
 
Resignations and Cancellations of Appointments 
 
School of Dentistry  
 
For Laila A. Al Dehailan, Assistant Professor, Department of Cariology, Operative Dentistry 
and Dental Public Health, resignation effective October 1, 2022, due to personal reasons.  
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School of Liberal Arts  
 
For Ch D. Gondola, Professor, Department of History, resignation effective July 1, 2022, to 
accept a position at John Hopkins University.  
 
School of Public and Environmental Affairs  
 
For Crystal A. Garcia, Associate Professor, resignation effective September 1, 2022.  
 
School of Science  
 
For George O. Mohler, Professor, Department of Computer Science, Director of the Institute 
for Mathematical Modeling and Computational Science (iM2CS), resignation effective June 1, 
2022, to accept a position at Boston College.  
 
University Libraries 
 
For Mike Paxton, Resource Sharing Librarian, resignation effective October 1, 2022 to 
pursue a position external to the university.   
 
Retirements and Emeritus Titles 
 
For Catherine A. Bonser-Neal, Associate Professor of Finance, retirement effective June 1, 
2022 with the title Associate Professor Emerita.  
 
Visiting Appointments  
 
IUPUC  
 
John Brinkman, Visiting Clinical Assistant Professor of Psychology and Mental Health 
Counseling, Division of Science, for the period August 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023.  
 
School of Dentistry  
 
Norah I. Almajed, Visiting Clinical Assistant Professor, Department of Cariology, Operative 
Dentistry and Dental Public Health, for the period September 12, 2022 to June 30, 2023.  
 
School of Health and Human Sciences 
 
Elizabeth A. Staats, Visiting Clinical Assistant Professor, Department of Physical Therapy, for 
the period September 1, 2022 to May 31, 2023.  
 
School of Social Work 
 
Jessica E. Adams, Visiting Lecturer, for the period August 15, 2022 to June 30, 2023.  
 
University Libraries 
 
Heather N. Myers, Visiting Resource Sharing and Discovery Librarian, for the period October 
1, 2022 to September 30, 2023.  
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SCHOOL OF MEDICINE: Executive Vice President and Dean Jay Hess 
 
Initial Appointments 
 
Sophia Abdulhai, Assistant Professor, Department of Surgery, for the period October 1, 
2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Saurav Acharya, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period September 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Iram Bakhtawar, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period November 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Savanna H. Bruski, Assistant Professor of Clinical Family Medicine, for the period September 
1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Nathan B. Buckley, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period October 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Callie Burgin, Assistant Professor of Clinical Dermatology, for the period September 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
David A. Campbell, Assistant Professor of Clinical Otolaryngology – Head and Neck Surgery, 
for the period October 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Samia Campbell, Lecturer, Department of Anesthesia, for the period October 1, 2022 to 
June 30, 2025.  
 
Diane Chen, Assistant Professor of Clinical Otolaryngology – Head and Neck Surgery, for the 
period October 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Jeanette W. Chung, Senior Research Professor, Department of Surgery, for the period 
October 1, 2022 to September 30, 2025.  
 
Sara P. Culleton, Assistant Professor of Clinical Psychiatry, for the period September 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Joshua S. Eng, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Surgery, for the period 
September 1, 2022 to August 31, 2023.  
 
Anne-Marie N. Fleckenstein, Assistant Professor of Clinical Neurology, for the period October 
1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Erin A. Henneberry, Assistant Professor of Clinical Psychiatry, for the period October 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Hera Jafri, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period October 1, 2022 to June 
30, 2025.  
 
Sunghan Jung, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Pathology and Laboratory 
Medicine, for the period August 15, 2022 to August 14, 2023.  
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Emily J. Kalscheur, Assistant Professor of Clinical Neurology, for the period September 1, 
2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Ateeq M. Khaliq, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Medicine, for the period 
September 1, 2022 to August 31, 2023.  
 
Erin M. Lips, Assistant Professor of Clinical Obstetrics and Gynecology, for the period 
October 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Aysam Mahmoud, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period September 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Brandon Mansoor, Assistant Professor of Clinical Radiology and Imaging Sciences, for the 
period October 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Michelle M. Martinez Irizarry, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Medicine, for the 
period September 1, 2022 to August 31, 2023.  
 
Ricardo Melo Ferreira, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Medicine, for the period 
October 1, 2022 to September 30, 2023.  
 
Allison E. Meyer, Assistant Professor of Clinical Psychiatry, for the period September 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Jagannath Misra, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Biochemistry and Molecular 
Biology, for the period September 8, 2022 to August 31, 2023.  
 
Edita Newton, Assistant Professor of Clinical Dermatology, for the period September 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Denny M. O’Brien, Assistant Professor of Clinical Pediatrics, for the period October 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
 
Paige J. Ostahowski, Assistant Professor of Clinical Emergency Medicine, for the period 
September 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Sujata Panthi, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period September 1, 2022 to 
June 30, 2025.  
 
Casey A. Pederson, Assistant Professor of Clinical Psychiatry, for the period September 1, 
2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Aki Puryear, George J. Garceau Professor of Pediatric Orthopaedics, effective September 1, 
2022, Professor of Clinical Orthopaedic Surgery, for the period September 1, 2022 to June 
30, 2025.  
 
Dhirendra P. Singh, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Medicine, for the period 
September 1, 2022 to August 31, 2023.  
 
Bri Sprague, Assistant Professor, Department of Medicine, for the period September 1, 2022 
to June 30, 2025.  
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Ryan Stewart, Assistant Professor of Clinical Obstetrics and Gynecology, for the period 
September 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Christopher B. Thomas, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period October 1, 
2022 to June 30, 2025.   
 
Keyur Vora, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Medicine, for the period August 1, 
2022 to July 31, 2023.  
 
Monica M. Williams-Farrelly, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Medicine, for the 
period September 1, 2022 to August 31, 2023.  
 
Shira Yahalom, Assistant Professor of Clinical Emergency Medicine, for the period October 1, 
2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Anthony D. Yang, Professor, Department of Surgery, for the period September 1, 2022 to 
June 30, 2025.  
 
Reappointments and Changes of Status 
 
For Atul Agarwal, Assistant Professor of Clinical Radiology and Imaging Sciences, the 
additional title of Assistant Professor of Clinical Neurology, for the period August 23, 2022 to 
June 30, 2025.  
 
For Levi Dolan, a change in title from Visiting Assistant Librarian to Assistant Librarian, Ruth 
Lilly Medical Library, for the period September 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
Leslie A. Hulvershorn, Associate Professor, Chair, Department of Psychiatry, Adjunct 
Associate Professor, Department of Anatomy, Cell Biology and Physiology, the additional 
title of IU Health Scholar II, effective June 1, 2022.  
 
For Rachel L. Hursh, a change in title from Acting Lecturer in Clinical Pathology and 
Laboratory Medicine to Assistant Professor of Clinical Pathology and Laboratory Medicine, for 
the period September 1, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
For Kari A. Lemme, Assistant Professor of Clinical Emergency Medicine, the additional title of 
Assistant Professor of Clinical Pediatrics, for the period August 15, 2022 to June 30, 2025.  
 
For Jenny S. Morgan, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, the additional title of William 
C. Jr. and Kim L. Lansford Scholar in Global Health, effective July 1, 2022.  
 
For Kathryn Nevel, Assistant Professor of Clinical Neurology, the additional title of Assistant 
Professor of Clinical Medicine, for the period October 1, 2022 to June 30, 2026.  
 
For Gang Peng, a change in title from Visiting Assistant Research Professor to Assistant 
Professor, Department of Medical and Molecular Genetics, for the period October 1, 2022 to 
June 30, 2025.  
 
For Ying Wang, Assistant Professor, Department of Anesthesia, the additional title of 
Assistant Professor, Department of Medicine, for the period September 12, 2022 to June 30, 
2024.   
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For Deanna R. Willis, Family Medicine Professor of Primary Care and Population Health 
Research, Professor, Department of Family Medicine, the additional title of Interim Chair, 
Department of Family Medicine, effective September 1, 2022.  
 
Resignations and Cancellations of Appointments 
 
For Rob L. Brossart, Lecturer, Department of Anesthesia, resignation effective October 8, 
2022, to accept another anesthetist position closer to family.  
 
For Johanne Eliacin, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Psychiatry, resignation 
effective September 1, 2022, to accept a research position in the Women’s Health Sciences 
Division, VA National Center for Post-Traumatic Stress Disorders.  
 
For Eric P. Hanson, Associate Professor, Department of Pediatrics, Associate Professor, 
Department of Microbiology and Immunology, resignation effective August 20, 2022.  
 
For Cherri D. Hobgood, Professor, Department of Emergency Medicine, resignation effective 
October 1, 2022.  
 
For Karen M. Hutchins, Assistant Professor of Clinical Radiation Oncology, resignation 
effective September 1, 2022.  
 
For Brian O’Neill, Assistant Professor of Clinical Emergency Medicine, resignation effective 
September 19, 2022, to accept a position at Eli Lilly.  
 
For Kelly L. Paul, Assistant Professor of Clinical Physical Medicine and Rehabilitation, 
Assistant Professor of Clinical Neurology, resignation effective August 16, 2022.  
 
For Philip D. Rosen, Assistant Professor of Clinical Otolaryngology – Head and Neck Surgery, 
Assistant Professor of Clinical Pediatrics, resignation effective September 24, 2022 to accept 
a position with Children’s of Alabama to be closer to family.  
 
For Khristian M. Sunga, Assistant Professor of Clinical Medicine, resignation effective 
September 8, 2022, to relocate for wife’s position at St. Louis University.  
 
For Lava R. Timsina, Assistant Professor, Department of Surgery, resignation effective 
September 17, 2022, to pursue a career as a Senior Biostatistician in clinical trials at a CRO 
company.  
 
For Jingwu Xie, Jonathan and Jennifer Simmons Professor of Pediatrics, Professor, 
Department of Pediatrics, Adjunct Professor, Department of Pharmacology and Toxicology, 
resignation effective August 27, 2022, to pursue possible new employment with NIH.  
 
For Lu Zhang, Assistant Research Professor, Department of Pediatrics, resignation effective 
October 1, 2022, to return to China.  
 
Retirements and Emeritus Titles 
 
For Morton C. Green, Associate Professor of Clinical Anesthesia, retirement effective August 
27, 2022, with the title Associate Professor Emeritus.  
 
For Loren K. Rood, Assistant Professor of Clinical Emergency Medicine, retirement effective 
May 4, 2022, with the title Clinical Assistant Professor Emeritus.  
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Visiting Appointments  
 
Ying Zhang, Visiting Assistant Research Professor, Department of Biochemistry and 
Molecular Biology, for the period October 1, 2022 to September 30, 2023.   
 
IUK – Chancellor Mark Canada 
 
Reappointments and Changes of Status 
 
School of Business 
 
For Bingxuan Guo, Assistant Professor of Business, 3rd year reappointment for academic 
year 2023-2024. 
 
For Esra Topcuoglu, Assistant Professor of Hospitality and Tourism, 3rd year reappointment 
for academic year 2023-2024. 
 
School of Humanities and Social Sciences 
 
For Lori Bruns, Lecturer in English and Language Studies, 3rd year reappointment for 
academic year 2023-2024. 
 
School of Nursing and Allied Health Professions 
 
For Samantha Fouts, Clinical Assistant Professor of Nursing, 3rd year reappointment for 
academic year 2023-2024 
 
For Michele Lasley, Lecturer of Nursing, 3rd year reappointment for academic year 2023-
2024. 
 
School of Sciences 
 
For Yang Liu, Assistant Professor of Computer Science, 3rd year reappointment for academic 
year 2023-2024. 
 
IUSB – Chancellor Susan Elrod 
 
Reappointments and Changes of Status 
 
School of Education 
 
For Kathleen Sullivan, Teaching Professor of Learning Strategies Specialist, updating title to 
Teaching Professor of Learning Strategies, effective August 1, 2022. 
 
Resignations and Cancellations of Appointments 
 
School of Education 
 
For Daniel Kmitta, Visiting Lecturer in Secondary/Foundations of Education, resignation 
effective August 1, 2022. 
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Visiting Appointments 
 
School of Education 
 
For Amy Jo Nussbaum, Visiting Lecturer in Elementary/Early Childhood Education, for the 
period of August 1, 2022 , through May 31, 2023. 
 




